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OF ORIGIN ITEM (US$) PRICE (USS)
REFERENCE NO.: 72/2023/64 CMF N [ :
100620231 10 199999-99-99  NOBID |FSM-DE00-001 PC I
100620231 20 99-999-99-99 |NO BID _FSM-DE00-003 i pC
10062023-1 30 miniplats and screws assorted size screw _FSM-DE00-004 3 B
_ 1.Full Instrument Set B N B i
100620231 40 125-402-99-07 | STANDARD HANDLE ONLY F.MICROSYSTEM 1,5MM DE 1 iec 500.00
100620231 50 25-491-97-07  SCREWDRIVER BLADE MAXDRIVE 2.0/23 MM, M _ = . _DbE i e 193.83 -
25-449-07-91  TWIST DRILL 1.5 X 50 X 7MM, J-NOTCH OE 3 rc 9000
25510-12-07  BENDING PLIERS _ 12CM et OE 1 e 17979
255161307  MODELLING PLIERS 51/4 N 3 2, | 15612 i B
254201807 CHAMPY TC-PLATE SHEARS _ R S A o "DE 1 Tec 750.00
125-441-1807 _ MINI-PLATE HOLDING FORCEPS ) ___pE e 120.27
50-325-01-07  FRACTURE REDUCTION CLAMP 15CM S ) DE 2 ¢ 32679 N
150-502-00-07  TRANSBUCCCAL Rack Complete System Including: iE | jper :
25472-25-07  CHEEKRETRACTOR, RING TYPE ) ) DE 1 pc 153.18
254723007  CHEEKRETRACTOR, BLADETYPE o b 1 500.00
25472.90-07 _SD-BIT FOR 25-472-25 AND 25-472-30 OE 1 .pc 195.45 B
150-501-01-07 _ HANDLE ONLY o E. A jee 500.00 3
150-501-05-07  UNIVERSAL TROCAR ONLY \DE a e - iam
100620231 |50-501-10-07  CHEEK RETRACTOR, CLOSED OE 1 e 275.00
10062023-1 /50-501-15-07  CANNULA - SINGLE THORN DE 1 13467
100620231 150-501-16-07  CANNULA - DOUBLE THORN ‘o€ 1. PG 12000 i
100620231 S0-501-1707 CANNUWA-SMOOTH  ~ - - . DE 1k 11034
100620231 2207 _DRILLC ) I 18483
100620231 '50-501-25-07 _ DRILL GUIDE, DLSMM 1 A
10062023-1 150-501-26-07  DRILL GUIDE, SHORT, UNIVERSAL i 160.35
10062023-1 50-501-27-07  DRILL GUIDE, D2.7 THREADLOCK RECON o o DE a e | 184.83
10062023-1 150-501-33-07 _ PLHOLDSOCKET FRACTUf . et . [oE 1|k 923.72 I
10062023-1 50-501-34-07 _ PLHOLDSOCKET 2.0MM ot 1l 27.77
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10062023-1 280 120 50-501-37-07 PL.HOLDSOCKET THREADLCOK RECON DE 1 PC 122.77 122.77
100620231 290 120 S0-501-4007 DEPTHGAUGE DE 1 pc 350.00 350.00
10062023-1 300 120 559612004  TRANSBUCCALMODULE WITHLID Autociave Cont./ Transbuccal Sys. ~ DE 1 pc 90000 900.00
100620231 -310 | 1030080006 Option 1. Microstop Containor 30X30X13.Not included Autoclave Cont./ Instruments.PL.Scr. I
100620231 320 | 554401304  CONTAINER Ms, 30X30X14 CM, HANDLE GREY o 1 e 1,400.00
330 554431204  COLOR-TAG, RED DE 2 ke 10.00
100620231 340 55-443-22.04  Coding label, MS2, w. text, w/o hole DE 1 eC 25.00
10062023-1 :350 2. Titanium miniplate and s&gwgs  assorted size zoq . i i
360 A a T L . 110
100620231 380 255510291 MINIPL, 2.0, 2HOLES, STRAIGHT, SHORT DE s pC 44.25
10062023-1 _MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, STRAIGHT DE 0 PC 65.07 i
520231 1255510491 MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, STRAIGHT, SHORT DE s FC 65.07
125-552-04-91  MINIPL., 2.0, 4-HOLES, STRAIGHT, LONG DE 5 PC 1 65.07 14
25-550-06-91  MINIPL, 2.0, 6-HOLES, STRAIGHT DE 15 pc 68.73 1,030.95
255520691  MINIPL, 20, 6HOLES, STRAIGHT, LONG DE 10 pC 6873 ~ 687.30
10062023-1 255500891  MINIPL, 2.0, -HOLES, STRAIGHT ) ? e DE s ke | 9630 1,444.50
100620231 255501691  MINIPL, 2.0,16-HOLES, STRAIGHT 7 DE 0k 151.80 303600
100620231 _ 50-368-16:61  MINIPL, 2.0,16-HOLES, STRAIGHT, 0.6MM ) ) N AN - - 0 e | 15042 1,504.20
10052023-1 50405-17-09  MINIPL. 2.0, 20-HOL, STRAIGHT, 1MM DE 5 B 199.83 599.15 |
77777 ] ! - 2.L shape plate of variable size 5 ; . | 40 <
100620231 600 25564-04-91  MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, L-SHAPE, R|,SHORT ) 0E 2 ke B 203.40
100620231 610 1 MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, LSHAPE, LESHORT , 3 2k 203.40
10062023-1 620 1 MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, 6B 4 ¢ |  406.80
100620231 630 |25:571.04.91  MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, LSHAPE, MED. . ! DE 4 PC 406.80
100620231 640 25-565-04.91  MINIPL, 2.0, 4-HOLES, L'SHAPE, R, LONG i 3 2 pc 10170 203.40
100620231 650 S 1 B oE 2 ke 10070 | 20340
10062023-1 1660 - ), A . il e _DE_ 4 PC 101.70 p ___406.80
100620231 670 _MINIPL, 2.0, 5-HOLES, L-SHAPE, LE % DE 4 FC 10170 406.80
100620231 680 MINIPL, 2.0, 6-HOLES, L:SHAPE, SHORTRI - 603.90
|10062023-1 6% MINIPL, 2.0, 6-HOLES, L-SHAPE, SHORTLE _ i sk 603.90
100620231 700 _MINIPL, 20, 6-HOLES, LSHAPE, LONG,RI_ K A 3 e 35034
0 MINIPL 2.0, 6-HOLES, L-SHAPE, LONG, LE i3 PC 352.3h
| 3omitalplate 3 ] ] I, .
150-400-06:91 _ TI-MINIPL., 2.0, ORBITA, 6-HOLES, 0.6MM i d o Toe 3k 11364
150-400-08-91 DE 3 rc 125.43
504051209 e 2 (3 2 ke 179.46
. ) . . 8
I e - DE 3 e 390.57
20231 780 | e (e DE 3 - 46074 22
100620231 790 | 25-043-17-09 oE 2 ec 567.66 1,135.32
80 1 - : -
100620231 810 | 253953409 - S e 1k 15399 15399
100620231 820 | 25-399-3209  ARNETT MINIPL TS DE 1 ec 193.02
10062023-1 830 50-304-03-09 _ ARNETT GENIOP! DE 1k 215.94
|, orem
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100620231 840 503040409 ARNETT GENIOPLASTY PLATE 2,0, 4 MM 3 ! DE 1 ec 21584 21592
100620231 850 25-397-31-09  ARNETT MINIPL. 2,0, L-SHAPE 0,8MM MEDIUM ) DE 1 e 188.64 138.64
10062023-1 860 25398-31-09  ARNETT MINIPL. 2,0, c-smPE 0,8MM MEDIUM i " 3 1 pC 188,64 188.64
100620231 870 25-397-27:09 . 3 1 FC 18462 184.62
100620231 880 25-398-27-09 R \\ DE 1 rc 17952 179.52
_ 80 F v mf’r( INCLUDED g N &
100620231 310 559610604 2.0 MINI MODULE STANDARD TRAUMA v utoclav(ConL/P!ates andOrbital  DE 1B 1,000.00
100620231 900 559622304  SCREW STORAGE MODULE W/RED SIDE RAIL /\ Autoclave Cont./Screws/ [ 850.00
100620231 910 155-963.08:04  LID SCREW STORAGE MODULE o ) ‘DE 1 e 179.52
960 3. Titanium mw&iameu(( 1.5-2mm) B “. ) 1000 &
10062023-1 970 258720409 MAXDRIVE SCREWS 2.0X4MM i ? DE o s 10500 420000
100620231 980 . 258720509 MAXDRIVESCREWS2OXSMM - DE 4 55 10500 420000
90 25-872-06-09  MAXDRIVE SCREWS 2.0X6MM N ? I3 50 55 10500 5,250.00
1000 25-872-07-09  MAXDRIVE SCREWS 2.07MM ) O s 7 ) DE 50 ss 105.00 5,250.00
11010 1254 _ MAXDRIVE SCREWS 2.0XLIMM e, o F DE 20 ss 11000 2,200.00
Sub-total ) 2,151,713.12
jozq . microplatesand screw assorted size scre _FSM-DEO0-00S i 28 34
1030 _ LFull instrumentset: Spass SRR, DS o S
1040 25402-99-07  'STANDARD HANDLE ONLY F.MICROSYSTEM 1,5MM -4 Ipe 558.09 55809
1050 | 254289807  SCREWDRIVER BLADE CENTRE DRIVE 1.0 MM B s T a__ - 16503 165.03
1060 - | 125.454.07-91  TWIST DRILL 0.7 X 50 X 7MM, J-NOTCH A b 3 P | 94.23 Ll 28269
1070 25488-1207  MICRO BENDING PLIERS o B 2w 26799 535.98
1080 25490-11-07  MICROPLATECUTTER v L 2 P 31233 62466
1090 s i A . 1 ec | mw | o
1100 ) LATE HOLDING | s e 1. SeC 1520 1520
= = AUTOCLAVES CONTAIONORS = i ' E— R, =
i . = OptionalL. Autoclave container for plates and screws _NOT INCLUDED
100520231 1110 559510104 1.0 MICRO MODULE ) Autoclave Cont./ Plates and Screws D L e 1187
100620231 1120 559521104  STORAGEMODULEWITHBLUESIDERAIL _ Autoclave Cont/ Instruments. _ DE v | 61092
100520231 1130 |LID STORAGE MODULE k ) ot 1 e | ips2
} 140000
; 'COLOR-TAG, RED 10.00
A, - _Coding label, MS2, w. text, w/o hole d 25.00 y =
un 2. Titanium microplates profile (0.3-0.8mm) ¥ e
100620231 1180 253300409 MICRO PL. 1.0, 4-HOLES, STRAIGHT M 98.49
10052023-1 1190 125330-0609  MICRO PL. 1.0, 6-HOLES, STRAIGHT 107.22 o
10052023-1 1200 11607 )
100620231 1210 12498
520 1220 158.34
10062023-1 1230 18237
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10062023-1 1240 _25-33026-09 MICRO PL. 1.0, 34-HOL, STRAIGHT DE 236.97 236.97
100620231 1250 25-33305-09  MICRO PL,, 1.0, 5-H, L-SHAPE, LE, SHORT 8 Lshape o€ 134.52 260.04
100620231 1260 25-334-0509  MICRO PL, 1.0, 5-H, LSHAPE, RI, SHORT" : € 13452 269.04
100620231 1270 25333-0809  MICRO PL, 1.0, 8-H, L-SHAPE, LE, LONG q e DE _ 18534 37068
100620231 1280 - 253340809 MICRO PL, 1 LSHAPE, RI, LONG " OE 185.34 37068
100620231 1290 | 1253320809 MICRO PL, 1.0, ORITA, 8- HOLES S orbital Plates DE 17937 896.85
100620231 1300 250430609  ORBITA MESH 1.0 MM, 0.2 MM, FAN SHAPE 3Orbital Mesf DE 535.77 1,071.54
100620231 1310 125043-07-09  ORBITAMESH 1.0 MM, 03 MM, FANSHAPE __DE_ . 584.04
100620231 1320 125-344-07-09  MICRO PL. 1.0, 7-H, DBL-Y-SHAPE, MEDIUM DE 20055
10062023-1 1330 L _; Microplate screws diameter (1.0-1. Smm) NS YN -
100620231 1340 256600409  TI-CENTREDRIVE MICRO SCREWS 1XAMM DE 24414 12070
100620231 1350 25-660-05-09  TI-CENTRE-DRIVE MICRO SCREWS 1XSMM _DE 24414 1,220.70
100620231 1360 25-660-06-09  TI-CENTRE-DRIVE MICRO SCREWS 1X6MM N _DE 25614 1,792.98
100620231 1370 25-660-07-09  TI-CENTRE-DRIVE MICRO SCREWS 1X7MM DE 256.14 1,792.98
10062023-1 1380 |25-661-03-09  TI-CENTRE-DRIVE EMERG. SCREWS 1.2X3MM DE 26868 806.04
100620231 1256610509 TI-CENTRE-DRIVE EMERG. SCREWS 1.2X5MM i DE 268.68 806.04
ol i I Sub-Total === : i i ] 467,762.40
100620231 1400 Reconstruction plates and screw FSM-DE00-006 a7
100620231 1410 1. Full instrument set: A N RS N 7 e
100620231 1420 _25-406-99-07  STANDARD HANDLE ONLY FMINI SYSTEM 2.0MM (i e DE . 1 PC . A 581.22
100620231 1430 125.487-97-07  SCREWDRIVER BLADE MAXDRIVE 2.7 MM SereL e L S e _DE - e 21228
100620231 1440 150-022:03-07 _ TWIST DRILL 2.2 X 105MM, J-NOTCH A (T . . _DE Sl e ! 43335
100620231 1450 50-504-23-07  THREADLTS BENDER-CUTTER D1.5/2.0/3.0(A) | . DE 1k 1,300.00
100620231 1460 50-504-24-07  THREADLTS BENDER-CUTTER D1.5/2.0/3.0(8) i DE 1 RC 1,75000
100620231 1470 50-205-17-07  PLATE HOLDING FORCEPS 16 CM ;| - IDE 1k 47827 47427
100620231 1480 __PLATE HOLDING FORCEPS = ___DE A iPC 35313 353.3
100520231 1490 'FRACTURE REDUCTION CLAMP 15CM ; i o ] OE 2 e 3679 65358
100620231 1500 50 7 TROCAR SYSTEM,COMPLINCL.TRANSB.RACK } DE 1 ipc z 5
100620231 1510 1500 25-472-2507 CHEEKRETRACTOR,RINGTYPE B ‘DE T | 153.18
100620231 1520 1500 25-472-30-07  CHEEKRETRACTOR, BLADE TYPE. i DE 3 e i
10062023-1 1530 1500 25-472.90-07  SD-BIT FOR 25-472-25 AND 25-472-30 DE a_ e ]
100620231 1540 1500 50-501-01-07  HANDLE ONLY ) ] DE 1 e b
100620231 1550 1500 SO-S01-05-07 UNIVERSALTROCARONLY e e W s IDE i e
10052023-1 1560 1500 50-501-10-07 | CHEEK RETRACTOR, CLOSED ) DE 1 _iPC
100620231 1570 _CANNULA - SINGLE THORN ) WSSy S _DE - i
10062023-1 1580 _CANNULA-DOUBLETHORN e ) I ) _DE 1. eC :
10062023-1 1590 _CANNULA»SMDOTH o b3 st e = e - o z - VDE it 1 _PC - J
100620231 1600 1500 50-501-22-07 - OE 1k
100620231 1610 1500 |50-501-25-07 i DE 1 ke
100620231 1620 1500 50-501-26-07 ‘DE 1_ic
100620231 1630 1500 50-501-27-07 iDE 1 iec
100620231 1640 1500 50-501-33-07 . | 3 o IDE [T
100620231 1650 1500 50-SI ILDSC mliie p _DE 1 e
10062023-1 1660 1500 50-501-37-07 _ PLHOLDSOC! OE 1 e
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10062023-1 1670 1500 50-501-40-07  DEPTH GAUGE OE 1 FC 350.00 350.00
100620231 1680 1500 55-961-2004  TRANSBUCCAL MODULE WITH LID P OE 1 pC 900.00 900.00
100620231 1690 55-969-58-04  Optional .INSTRTRAY PRECONF.300X300MM W.LID TLTS.Not Included »Aut7élaver€ent;/ Instruments. DE 4 1,200.00
100620231 1730 2. Titanium reconstruction plate profile ) P G 3 =g
100620231 1740 50-796-06-09  FRACTURE PL.6-HOLES STRAIGHT W.BAR T=3.0 = 8 DE s IPC 207.18 1,035.90
100620231 1750  50-794-2009  RECON PLATE 20-HOLES STRAIGHT T=3.0 MM g DE PC 500.00 2,500.00
10062023-1 1760 507952609 RECON PLATE 6+20-HOLES RIGHT T=3.0 MM DE 0 PC 75000 7,500.00
100620231 1770 '50-793-26-09  RECON PL6+20HOLES LEFT T=3.0MM ANATOMIC o DE 10 PC 85000 850000
10062023-1 1780 150-799-28-09 _ Recon Plate 6+16+6-Holes T=3.0 mm DE 1k 75000 75000
100620231 1790 50-799-30-09  Recon Plate 6+18+6-Holes T=3.0 mm DE 1 lpc 800.00 800.00
100620231 1800 50-174-01-09  THREADLOCKTS CONDYLAR IMPLANT RIGHT L > _DE 2 FC 82000 1,640.00
10062023-1 1810 50-174-02-09  THREADLOCK TS CONDYLAR IMPLANT LEFT DE 2 pC 820.00 1,640.00
100620231 1820 . 55-961-24-04  Optional .INSERT MODULE THREADLOCK TS T=3.0 COMPLNot Included Autoclave Cont.//Plates and Screws  DE 1k 1,12605
10062023-1 1860 i 3. Titanium screw ( locking and non lock Screws). = \ i 300 i -
100620231 1870 125-886-10-09 | MAXDRIVE SCREW 2.7X10 MM B e - 1 _DE 3 58 28443 85329
100620231 1880 | 25-887-11.09  MAXDRIVE LOCKING SCREWS 2.7X11MM i i ) DE 3 iss 25743 772.29
100620231 1890 25885-0809  MAXDRIVE SCREW 2.7X8 MM OE 10 ss 269.07 2,690.70
100620231 1900 25-887-09.09  MAXDRIVE LOCKING SCREWS 2.7X9MM VI e _oDE 10 s 257.43 2,574.30
100620231 1910, 25-886-12-09  MAXDRIVE SCREW 2.7X12 MM N A . DE 0 ss 28443 2,844.30
10062023-1 1920 125-887-1309  MAXDRIVE LOCKING SCREWS 2.7X13MM - e o 26757 261570
10062023-1 1930 99-999-99-99  NO BID / NO EMERGENCY SCREWS NEEDED 4.70 SCREW EMERGANCY DE c N
supTotal ! . i | T 2,206697.94
2 11940 125-323-17-71 _ marPOR PE-Sheet,76x127mm,t=0.85 mm .  FSM-DE17007 DE 27 PC__ 90000 20430000
10062023-1 i § .
100620231 1950 e _FSM-DE17-009 I 55 | | i
100620231 1960 . DE 5 PC 2,25000 11,250:00
10062023-1 1970 007 SCREW! ] DE s e | 25836 1,291.80
100620231 1980 258750409  MAXDRIVE SCREWS 1.5X4MM : DE 15 s 16218 2,432.70
10062023-1 1990 1258750509 MAXDRIVESCREWS1SXSMM : DE B s 18225 2,733.75
10062023-1 2000 2 external maxillary distractor R ] ol 8 { 5
10062023-1 2010 5800004 POLLEY MIDFACE DISTRACTOR, SET ) § DE 10 STz 1600000 160,000.00
10062023-1 2020 515759007  HEXAGONAL SCREWDRIVER i ) i ‘DE 10 pC 63399 6,339.90
10062023-1 2030 51-575-1009  TITANIUM FIXATION SCREWS,4SMM 10/PA .~ "DE 10 1P - 135312 1353120
100620231 _ '51.582.50.04 _RED RETENTION PLATE 1,5 MM SET = 0l DE__ 10 SET . 200000 20,000.00
10062023-1 DE 0 55 16218 4865.40
10062023-1 § " . - ) Bogi s
10062023-1 B - DE 10 PC 300000 30,000.00
10062023-1 1 _51491 91-09 . DE 10 PC 48765 487650
100620231 2090 51-401-50-09 rliewii=ligres = s DE _ 10__C 65520 6,552.00
100620231 2100 OE 10 PC 25836 2,583.60
10062023-1 2110 DE 0 s 1221 | 1622.10
10062023-1 2120 . OE 055 18225 182250
10062023-1 2130 .
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100620231 2140 51.601-00-09 3D X STANDARD SET p DE 10 pC 9,000.00 90,000.00
10062023-1 2150 51-600-75-07 3D X PATIENT SCREWDRIVER / DE 0 pC 258.33 2,583.30
10062023-1 2160 |51-600-85-07 MOLINA SCREWDRIVER FOR PINS DE 10 PC 275.88 2,758.80
100620231 2170 |51-606-40-09  MOLINA FIXATION PINS 2X42MM, 2 EACH DE 40 2 15624 6,249.60
10062023-1 2180 5- transport distractor for cleft i - <
10062023-1 2150 [51-650-20-09  LIOU CLEFT TRANSP.DISTRACTOR 20MM, LEFT DE 10 pc 2,500.00 25,000.00
100620231 2200 |51-525-85-07  PATIENT SCREWDRIVER, STRAIGHT DE 10 P | 25833 2,583.30
100620231 2210 1258750409  MAXDRIVE SCREWS 1.5X4MM DE 20 s 16218 3,243.60
100620231 2220 1258750509 MAXDRIVE SCREWS 1.5XSMM DE 0 ss 182.25 3,645.00
100620231 2230 . & transportdistractor for bone defeet ol N
100620231 2240 '51-700-50-09  THREADLOCK TRANSPORT DISTRACTOR, SOMM DE 0 pC 350000 3500000
100620; 2250 51-401-91-09 _ SINGLE CARDANIC EXTENSION FOR ACTIV.ARM DE 0 pc 48765 4,876.50
'51-401-50-09 _ RIGID CLIPABLE ACTIV.ARM INCLCARD. SOMM DE 10 pC 655.20 6,552.00
'51-500-90-07  SCREWDRIVER FOR 51-500XX ) . DE 10 pC 25833 2,583.30
25-875-04-09  MAXDRIVE SCREWS L.5X4MM ’ DE 30 s 16218 4,865.40
25-875-05-09  MAXDRIVE SCREWS 1.5XSMM DE 30 s 182.25 5,467.50
10062023-1 | | |
100620231 2300 . orbitalplate 'FSM-DE17-010 160 i 3
100620231 2310 25-325-06-91  MICRO PL, 1.5, ORBITA, 6-HOLES DE E 13623 408690
100620231 2320 | 25-32508:91  MICRO PL, 1.5, ORBITA, 8-HOLES DE_ I 13863 4,158.90
100620231 2330 25325-10-91  MICRO PL, 1.5, ORBITA10-HOLES i 25 pc_ | 1409 3,523.50
100620231 2340 150-400-06-91 _ TI-MINIPL., 2.0, ORBITA, 6-HOLES, 0.6MM R SN e 25 eC 113.64  2,841.00
100620231 2350 |50-400-08-91 _ TI-MINIPL., 2.0, ORBITA, 8-HOLES, 0.6MM - 25 pc 125.43 3,135.75
100620231 2360 | 50-405-1209  MINIPL 2.0, ORBITA, 12-HOL 2% FC 179.43 448575
100620231 2370 99-999-99-99  NO BID i N ) FSM-DE22.011 DE |
100620231 2380 199.999-99:99  NOBID _ FSM-DE22012 DE PC
10062023-1 2330 199-999-99-99  NO BID FSM-DE22:014 DE PC —
100620231 2400 titanium micromesh B _FSM-DE22-015 i 306 b R
10062023-1 2410 25:007-80-09 3D MESHS0X 80 MM, 03 MM ) N [ 3% PC 2,000.00 3
10062023-1 2420 125-005-12-09  MICRO MESH,10-HOLES, 0.3MM R § = DE 75 pC 1,287.69 r
100620231 2430 25003-10-09  MICRO MESH,12-HOLE,0.3MM - oE %0 PC 1,025.88
100620231 2040 125040-25-09  MICRO MESH, 25-HOLES, 0.2MM DE 80 PC . 63159
10062023-1 2450 25:004-25:09  MICRO MESH 160X135MM, 0.6MM I DE 3 pc 3,000.00 L]
10062023-1 2450 199-999-99-99  NOBID RSl ), i FSM-DE22-016 DE e
100620231 2470 999999999 NOBID ) FSM-DE22-017 K
10062023-1° 2480 199999-99-99  NO BID i [FSM-DE22:018 DE PC B
100620231 2490 199999-99-99 *NO BID  FsmM-DE22019 DE PC . -
2500, 1999999999 NOBID - 22020 \DE e |
2510 1999999999 NOBID 4 N FSM-DE22021 pc | e o
252 199999-99.99  NOBID _ : = _ FSM-DE22022 e i 2
2530 999999999 NoBO |FSM-HE-026 e ape 1 i
2540 199-999-99-99  NO BID ) - FSM-HE18-028 [ = B
2550 99-999-99.99  NO BID  FSM-DE0O-029 [___ec |
2560 225270505 Bone wire |FSM-DE00-030 Is03 jec .~ 8123 1570869
2570 _22527-06-05 _Bone wire shtd 0 |FSM-DE00-031 135 PG 3438 | 464130
2580 - 199-999-99-9 NOBID FSM-DEDO-032 PC S
< v
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100620231 2590 99-999-99.99  NO8ID _FSM-DE20-033 DE PC
10062023-1 2600 199999-99-99  NOBID ) FSM-DE20-034 DE PC
Note: Autoclaves containors are F.0.C. but with Quanitities related to Number of sets awarded %
to our company
TOTAL 5,924,798.15
<y

KLS Martin Platz 1

78532 Tuttingen / Germany

|attentiont B
Please consider that this offer may include articles which are not yet registered in your country.

Manufacturer: KLS Martin Group - Gebrider Martin GmbH & Co. KG
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‘ogether for o Healthy| L ifdSM-DEN-XI Arch Bar oll |Rollof I meter| 572 $00 | §171600
‘ 2 [ FsMDE0C-0 Elastc bands pk.of 10 I 5300 599,300
| |

T
pk
miniplats and screws assorted size screws of different size (2.0,1.5 mm in diameter and 5-9 mm in length)

the set containes : l.FullinmnunqIjﬂwdrivnlnddrdlﬁtuﬁiﬂbhfus()smw)‘l.pl&
‘bﬂﬂmofdiﬂ'mlyps(m)lﬂmnmllm).d.ph&hm Instrument (2pcs). .. Bone holding |
inmmn(ba)&‘l‘nmbumlsyﬂm(lpu), 7 Autoclave Container (1). 2. Titanium miniplate (200pcs) | { ’

1 Stright plate variabl size(110pes). 2L shape pate of variabl sze (40pes). 3orbtal plate (Spcs), = 8 ez
‘ ! A.orbital mesh (8pes). 5.others (orthognathic) (8pcs). 6 Autoclave container for plates and screws Diameter '
| | afminivh:ﬁoml.o-l.mml.Tmniummd‘muu(l.&lm)l(mpu 1. 400pcs 4-5mm length 2.
3 FSM-DEOG-0M4 | 500pes 6-8mm length 3. 100pes 10-12 mm length | | |
| i [mmplmnamumusiumm|.ummm1.funimumm:l.5aewmmm1 \ [
drill bit (3 drill bit for 50 screw). 2. plate benders (2pes) 3. plate cutters (2pes). 4 plate holding instrument | |
(2pes)S Autoclavable Contaner, 1) 2. Tanium microplates profile (0.3-0.8mm) 1. Stright of variable sizes m ‘ 5 | seow | suson |
| (20pes). 2. L shape of variabe sizes (8 pes).3.orbital plate (S pes). 4. orbitalmesh (3 pes). S others (1) 3. | s
Miauphmnm&hm(l.ﬂ‘ljm)ISOmI,SOm#SmmhﬂthmMmmkngth, |
4 FSM-DE0C-005 3.30 screw emergency. | | | ‘
’ | reconstuction plates and srew with and without head of condyle differntlengh andsize for mandible ‘
width reconstruetion plates 2.7mm screw size2.7 1. Full insrument set: . Serew driver and dril bit (3 dll
bi for S0screw). 2. plate bendersof iferentsizes (3pes) 3 plate cutting instruments (2 pes) 4. plte olcing ‘
instrument (2 pes) 5. Bone holding instrument (2pcs). 6.transbuccal system (1) 7.Autoclave Container.(1) 2.
Titenium reconstruction plate profile( 2.3-3mm) Locking and non locking (36 pes). 1.stright plate short ( § set 47 §18,000 ‘ $846,000 1
pes). 2. strght plae log (Spes). 3. Angled plat ( igh).(10pes) 4 Angled plate (lef. (10pes) . Biangled
phn(ZquRmmimphnwi\hmdyluhnd(dpu)ﬂthvemfuphkndmm‘ |
(1).3. Taanium screw ( locking and non locking) iameter ( 2.7mm) 300pcs. 1. 30 screw 10mm Length2. | ‘ |
s FSM-DE00-006 100 screw $mm Length 3. 100 screw 12mm Length 4. 70 screw Emergarcy ‘
6 FSMDEIT007 | Medpare plastic materal) iffrent types and sze for maillofacil econstruction s | w 500 | stmas0 |
| (— T
osto disacar consstof: 1 ntemal mavilary disrcor 2-extenal maxilly istactor 3 vernal ‘ ‘
mwndmtwmﬁmhms-mmﬁmhmammﬁm‘ | $4,000 §220,000
7 FSM-DEIT09 | forbonedefeet) st | 55 ‘ |
8 FSM-DEIT00 | onbital plate ps 160 $500 $80000
9 FSMDE2LOI | surgical ghue w10 $500 $51500 |
10 FSMDEZOR | surgial staples | $0 | sestt00 |
il FSMDEROM | iodoform gauze s | s [ s | sram
[ n FSMDEROIS | ttanium micromesh | ks a6 | s | saeam
| B FSM-DEROI6 | pressive facial dressing [ e | W $100 $49200
[ u FSMDEROI | wrephine bur kit | ki | & $500 $3450 |
15 FSM-DE2-018 PRF (platclt rich fibrin) ‘ ST [ 16 | sow0 | suson
[ 16 FSM-DE22-019 PRP (platelt rch plastma) | ser | 1000 | s1z3000 |
‘ 17 FSM-DE22-020 fat transfere set | ser [ @ | s | swow |
[ FSM-DE22-021 bane substitute T $600 678600 |
L FSMDERO2 | collagen membrane s 1062 800 | SBA9600 |
[ FSM-HEOG-026 | Surgical marking pen s @ | s $43.200
D FSM-HE15-028 pourous polyetheline sheets pes 142 $300 $42600
2 : 0
2| FMDENOS | Ligature wire 04 & 05 soft 5 oll ol 165 $300 $49,500
|3 [ FMDEwon | Soft . wire 05, roll/ Sm. length | nl 503 $00 | sts00 |
% | FsMDE0G0 | Soft$.5 wire 06, oll Sm. lengh roll B | sw0 | s0500 |
A FSM-DE0C-032 haemostaic agent (sponge) | s | 264 | 8100 | s |
[V \ FSM-DE20033 Surgical membrane [ b w [ s $66000 |
5 X Y e e i i g | 85,078,100 |




Quick Lase 48 ,i-Y

Corg >
- X
1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
Brief Description of Goods | & | Country
cription of E & of origin Price per physical unit Total Price
physical
& unit
] New
National National Seller item
code code code No. i & DDP Incidental DDP at
ni at services End-
Product Pack price | End | definedin | stes | onClPfires delivery at
size (UsSD) user, | schedule of | Incidental End-user, site. (USD)
site | Requirement Series

Maxilla Facial

FSM-DE00-004 | CMFV1.5/2.0 1 1.5mm/2.0mm Set 43 Germany | $18,470.82 | N/A N/A N/A $794,245.26
Maxilla Facial Micro

FSM-DE00-005 CMFV1.0 2 1.0mm Set 28 Germany | § 4,676.19 | N/A N/A N/A $130,933.32
Mandibular Reconstruction

FSM-DE00-006 CMFV2.7 3 2.7mm Set 47 Germany | $17,613.69 | N/A N/A N/A $827,843.43

Total Amount (One Million Seven F Fifty-Three Th Twenty-Two Dollars and One Cent) $1,753,022.01

OSTEONIC 4S yi-¢

e

i Abroad
3. Price Schedule for Goods to be imp orted from
’—‘--

Brief Description of Goods
Quantity \
Seller code 0";'“
Unit pack physical Country
o unit of origin
(b)
(b)

Roﬂ‘l‘ . mm
i “‘ st 1 metet
El bands pk. bid
SR m B b E
FSM- - m

: .26
< Mini plates with 1.5mm,1.95mm and e ih 16,:;%
: d sizes Kotoa
‘tist: emergency SCrews, assorte 7 »
FMDE 78 length 4-12mm with instruments set.
| . | cod 116,814.32 USD
“| Micro plates with 1.3mm,1.5mm and 4,1}510
emergency SCrews, length 4-8mm,
: “assorted sizes with instruments set.

Total Price on DDP/Free
Delivery at End-user,
site.(USD)

CIP
pvlcn(BIdder
National code T

place of
destination)
(@

den 3x5(d)

FSM-DE00-005
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Reconstruction plates and screws
Refer to item locking and non-locking 2.4mm and South 13.877.13
5 - 5 Set hohed
FSM-DE00-005 Pagh‘ms emergency, assorted sizes, len gth 8- 47 Koraa USD NIA | NIA | NIA 652,225.11 USD
12 with instruments set.
FSM-DE17-007 Medpore (plastic material) different
NIA 6 | types and size for maillofacial Pcs No bid No bid No bid No bid
reconstruction
osteo distracter consist of:
1- internal maxillary distractor
2- external maxillary distractor
FSM-DE17-009 NIA 7 | 3- internal mandibular distractor set Nobid | Nobid No bid No bid
4- external mandibular distractor
5- transport distractor for cleft
6- transport distractor for bone defeet
) |
Refer to item
FSM-DEI7-010 | st © | & | Orbitalplates Pes o | Soun | 2482 | ya | wA | WA | 393920 USD
'age
FSM-DE22-011 N/A 9 | surgical glue Pcs No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-012 surgical staples Pcs No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-014 iodoform gauze Pcs No bid No bid | No bid
South 60.51
FSM-DE22-015 n Pcs 306 Korea USD NA | NIA | NIA 18,516.06 USD
FSM-DE22-016 compressive.facial dressin, sheet No bid No bid No bid No bid
fTSM-DE22-01 7 NIA 14 | trephine bur kit~ kit No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-018 NIA 15 | PREF (platelet rich fibrin) SET | Nobid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-019 NIA 16| PRP (platelet rich plasma) SET No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-020 NIA 17_| fat transfere set SET No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-021 NIA 18 | bone substitute pes No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE22-022 N/A 19 | collagen membrane pes No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-HE00-026 NIA 20 | Surgical marking pen pes No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-HE18-028 NIA 21 urous polyetheline sheets s No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE00-029 NIA 22 | Ligature wire 0.4 & 0.5 soft S.8 Lroll roll Nobid | Nobid No bid No bid
Ty A e
Section 1V Bidding Forms 6
FSM-DE00-030 NIA 23 | Soft S.S wire 0.5, roll / 5Sm. length roll Nobid | Nobid No bid [ No bid
FSM-DE00-031 NIA 24 | Soft S.S wire 0.6 , roll / 5Sm. length roll No bid No bid No bid [ | No bid
FSM-DE00-032 N/A 25 | haemostatic agent (sponge) pes No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE20-033 NIA 26 | Surgical membrane pes. No bid No bid No bid No bid
FSM-DE20-034 NIA 27 | Bone wax pes. No bid No bid No bid No bid

Grand Total of Bid price: (1,485,783.87) USD (In figures)

ONE MILLION FOUR HUNDRED EIGHTY-FIVE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHTY-THHREE US DOLLARS AND

EIGHTY-SEVEN CENTS (In words)

s et ia ALl T IE ALIAMTITIES ADNEDER

PMAZS ,5-0



vear Sirs,

we thank you for the enquiry and are offering:

Pieces
Qty of Unit Price |  Total Price
Art. No. Description i) per USD UsD
FSM-DE00-004 - Mini-plating system
50-31-103 medium plate, straight, 4-holes, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 10| 1 $30,27 $302,70
50-31-105 medium plate, str., 4-h.,w. 8 mm bar 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 10, 1 $31,01 $310,10
50-31-107 medium plate, straight, 6-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 10 1 $33,18 $331,80,
50-31-109 medium plate, straight, 8-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 10, 1 $37,82 $378,20
50-31-110 medium plate, straight,16-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 10 1 549,57, $495,70
50-31-203 medium plate, straight,24-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 564,89 $324,45
50-31-115 medium L-plate, 4-holes w. 6 mm bar right, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $36,10 5180,50
50-31-116 medium L-plate, 4-holes w. 6 mm bar left, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $36,10 5180,50)
50-31-117 medium L-plate, 4-holes w. 8 mm bar right, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 5 3 536,60 $183,00
50-31-118 medium L-plate, 4-holes w. 8 mm bar left, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM S 1 36,60 $183,00
50-31-135 medium orbita plate, 6-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 $37,32 $74,64
50-31-136 medium orbita plate, 8-holes 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 540,47 $80,94
50-36-601 Orbital Floor Mesh TITANIUM 2 1 $168,92 $337,84]
50-36-602 Orbital Floor Mesh TITANIUM 2 1 5168,92 $337,84]
50-36-603 Orbital Floor Mesh, left TITANIUM 2 1. 248,19 $496,38,
50-36-604 Orbital Floor Mesh, right TITANIUM 2 1 $248,19 $496,38,
50-31-123 medium T-plate, narrow, 4-holes w. 8 mm bar, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $32,94 32,94
50-31-124 medium T-plate, narrow, 4-holes w. 12 mm bar, 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $33,75 $33,75
50-31-128 medium Y-Plate, 5-holes, TITANIUM 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $36,13 536,13
50-31-129 medium Y-Plate, 5-holes w. 12 mm bar 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $37,02 $37,02
50-31-302 medium cross head screws @ 1,5 x4 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 25 5 $46,01 $1.150,25
50-31-303 medium cross head screws @ 1,5 x 5 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 25 5 $46,01 $1.150,25
50-31-304 medium cross head scréws @ TSw%6 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 15 5 546,01 $690,15!
50-31-305 medium cross hefid screws- 315 &7 self tapping, TITANIUM 15 5 $46,01 $690,15
50-31-306 medium cross/f rews @ 1,5 2an, self tapping, TITANIUM N . T w9 e 546,01 $460,10|
L TOm Y ICSSTUCR
3 : < 4 ;

Tel.: +49 7424 98230-30 Ontario 23 v Managing Director: Se
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2 4 Tende

; Pieces
Qty of Unit Price | Total Price
Art. No. Description R pe; UsD UsD

50-31-307 medium emergency screw, @ 1,9 x5 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 2 5 $46,01 $92,02
50-31-339 medium emergency screw, @ 1,9 x 7 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 2 5 $46,01 $92,02
50-31-341 medium emergency screw, @ 1,9 x 9 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 1 5 546,01 $46,01,
50-32-122 mini orbita plate, 8-holes 0,6mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 $41,51 $83,02
50-32-123 mini orbita plate, 10-holes 0,6mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 $47,10 $94,20
50-32-157 mini plate, straight, 4-holes 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 10 1] $30,86 $308,60
50-32-158 mini plate, straight, 4-holes, 9 mm bar 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 10, 1 $31,28 $312,80
50-32-161 mini plate, straight, 6-holes 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 10, 1 534,25 $342,50
50-32-163 mini plate, straight, 8-holes 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 10, 1 $38,80 $388,00
50-32-165 mini plate, straight, 16-holes 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 10 1 $51,18 $511,80
50-32-166 mini plate, straight, 24-holes 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 67,15 $335,75,
50-32-168 mini L-plate, 4-holes, right 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $36,22 $181,10
50-32-169 mini L-plate, 4-holes, left 1,0 mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $36,22 $181,10
50-32-170 mini L-plate, 4-holes, 9 mm bar, right 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $36,96 $184,80
50-32-171 mini L-plate, 4-holes, 9 mm bar, left 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 536,96 $184,80
50-32-180 mini T-plate, broad, 5-holes w. 12 mm bar, 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $38,89 $38,89
50-32-181 mini T-plate, broad, 6-holes 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 39,10 $39,10
50-32-190 mini Y-plate, 5-holes. w. 12 mm bar Y-bar 6x6 mm, 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $39,10 $39,10
50-32-191 mini Y-plate, 5-holes. w. 6 mm bar Y-bar 6x6 mm, 1,0mm x 2,0 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 $38,15 $38,15
50-32-321 mini cross head screws @ 2,0 x 5 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 30 5 546,01 $1.380,30
50-32-322 mini cross head screws @ 2,0 x 6 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 20 5 $46,01 $920,20
50-32-323 mini cross head screws @ 2,0 x 7 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 20 5 $46,01 $920,20
50-32-324 mini cross head screws @ 2,0 x 8 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 20 5 $46,01 $920,20
50-32-326 mini cross head screws @ 2,0 x 10 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 8 5 $46,01 $368,08
50-32-327 mini cross head screws @ ) 20X T mm~_ self tapping, TITANIUM 8 5 546,01 $368,08
50-32-328 mini cross head screw; YA2 8/, "\ |self tapping, TITANIUM 4 5 $46,01 $184,04
50-32-334 mini emergency screW @23 x 5 mm NC "\ |self tapping, TITANIUM 2 5 $46,01 $92,02
50-32-335 self tapping, TITANIUM 2 5 $46,01 $92,02
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Tender No.

Art. No. Description aty of "::’ Unit Price | Total Price
packs ) usp usp
50-32-377 mini emergency screw, @ 2,3 x 9 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 2 5 $46,01 $92,02
10-11-741 bottom non-perforated, 465x280x135 mm 1 1 FOC FOC|
10-11-786 lid perforated, 465x280 mm, blue 1 1 FOC FOC,
10-06-684 wire basket 255x245x70 mm 1 1 FOC FOC
50-32-500 plate cutting pliers 180 mm, TC 2 1 FOC! FOC|
50-32-502 flat pliers 150 mm 2 1 FOC FOC
50-32-503 ADERER plate bending pliers, 130 mm 2 1 FOC FOC|
50-32-506 plate and screw hold. forceps, 100 mm angled, TITANIUM 2 1 FOC FOC|
50-32-509 screwdriver handle only for all screwdriver blades 2 1 FOC, FOC!
50-32-520 transbuccal drilling guide 1 1 FOC| FOC|
06-15-115 reduction forceps 135 mm with points 2 1 FOC FOC
50-31-003 rack for plates and screws 1,5mm system 1 1 FOC| FOC|
50-31-514 screwdriver blade only, self-holding for cross head screws, 100 mm 2 1 FOC| FOC|
50-31-525 twist drill @ 1,3 x 47 mm, WL5 mm with stryker coupling 3 1 FOC| FOC]
50-31-526 twist drill @ 1,3 x 50 mm, WL 8 mm with stryker coupling 3 1 FOC FOC|
50-32-003 rack for plates and screws 2,0mm system 1 1 FOC FOC
50-32-514 screwdriver blade only, self-holding for cross head screws, 100 mm 2 1 FOC FOC
50-32-525 twist drill @ 1,5x 50 mm, WL 7 mm with stryker coupling 3 1 FOC| FOC|
50-32-526 twist drill @ 1,5x 50 mm, WL 20 mm with stryker coupling 3 1 FOC]| FOC c
Total Price per Set $17.805,63
Total Price for 43 Sets $765.642,09
MARKE "= e
y i LS i
Pieces
Art. No. Description :’d:f per u"::;:“ T“;'s':ke
FSM-DE00-005 - Micro-plating sy
50-30-101 micro plate, straight, 4-holes 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 5 ) 48,78 $243,90
50-30-102 micro plate, straight, 6-holes 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $51,70 258,50
50-30-103 micro plate, straight, 8-holes 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 56,34/ 281,70
50-30-105 micro plate, straight, 16-holes 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 $68,12 340,60
50-30-107 micro L-plate, 5-holes, right 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 56,46 112,92
50-30-108 micro L-plate, 5-holes, left 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 56,46 112,92
50-30-109 micro L-plate, 8-holes, right 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 2 i} 63,75 $127,50,
50-30-110 micro L-plate, 8-holes, left 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 63,75 $127,50
50-30-113 micro Y- Plate, 6-holes, TITANIUM 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 54,79 $54,79
50-30-117 micro orbita plate, 8-holes 0,6mm x 1,2 mm, TITANIUM 5 1 58,96 $294,80
50-36-605 Orbital Floor Mesh TITANIUM 1 1 $187,61 $187,61
50-36-606 Orbital Floor Mesh, left TITANIUM 1 1 266,88 266,88
50-36-607 Orbital Floor Mesh, right TITANIUM 1 1 $266,88 $266,88
50-30-303 micro cross head screws, § 1,2 x 4 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 5 5 573,84/ $369,20
50-30-304 micro cross head screws, 3 1,2 x5 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 5 5 73,84 $369,20
50-30-305 micro cross head screws, $ 1,2 x 6 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 5 5 73,84 $369,20
50-30-306 micro cross head screws, $ 1,2 x 7 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 5 5 $73,84 $369,20
50-30-307 micro cross head screws, @ 1,2 x 8 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 4 5 73,84 $295,36
50-30-325 emergency screws, cross head, @ 1,4x5mm self tapping, TITANIUM 3 5 $73,84 $221,52 n
50-30-327 emergency screws, cross head, @ 1,4x7mm self tapping, TITANIUM 3 5 $73,84 $221,52 <
10-61-189 bottom non-perforated, 285x140x100 mm 1 1 FOC| FOC
10-11-174 lid perforated, 300x140 mm, silver 1 1 FOC FOC]
10-56-151 basket 270x125x20 mm for mini container Stainless steel screen 1 1 FOC FOC|
50-30-003 Rack for plates and screws 1 1 FOC FOC
50-30-501 plate cutting pliers, TC, 160 mm 2 1 FOC FOC|
50-30-502 flat pliers 150 mm 1 1 FOC FOC]
50-30-503 ADERER plate bendi 1] 1 FOC FOC|
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Date: 01
Tender No.: 72

{

Pieces
Qty of Unit Price [ Total Price
Art. No. Description By per usb usb
50-30-506 plate and screw hold. forceps, 100 mm angled, TITANIUM 2 1 FOC FOC,
50-30-513 screwdriver handle only for all screwdriver blades 1 1y FOC FOC
50-30-514 scewdriver blade only, self-holding for cross head screws 1 1 FOC FOC]
50-30-525 twist drill @ 1,0 x 46 mm, WL 4 mm with stryker coupling 2 1 FOC! FOC
50-30-526 twist drill @ 1,0 x 50 mm, WL 8 mm with stryker coupling 2 ) FOC FOC
Total Price per Set $4.891,70
Total Price for 28 Sets $136.967,60
FSM-DE00-006 - Reconstruction system
50-34-008 mandib. reconstruction plate, str., 8-h. 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 $140,58] 421,74
50-34-011 mandib. reconstruction plate, str.,11-h. 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 $160,11 320,22
50-34-014 mandib. reconstruction plate, str.,14-h. 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 174,84 $524,52
50-34-017 mandib. reconstruction plate, str.,17-h. 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 189,70 $379,40
50-34-112 mandibular angle plate, 4/8 holes, left 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 199,70 $599,10
50-34-212 mandibular angle plate, 4/8 holes,right 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 199,70 $599,10|
50-34-115 mandibular angle plate, 4/11 holes, left 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 214,56 $643,68
50-34-215 mandibular angle plate, 4/11 holes,right 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 3 1 214,56 $643,68
50-34-118 mandibular angle plate, 4/14 holes, left 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 229,41 $458,82
50-34-218 mandibular angle plate, 4/14 holes,right 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 $229,41 458,82
50-34-120 mandibular angle plate, 6/14 holes, left 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1] $239,41 478,82
50-34-220 mandibular angle plate, 6/14 holes,right 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 2 1 239,41 478,82 = =
50-34-425 full mandibular plate, 4/17/4 holes 2,7 mm, TITANIUM 1 1 280,61 $280,61
50-34-431 full mandibular plate, 6/19/610les, 2,7 mm TITANIUM 1 1 310,47, 310,47
50-34-500 joint head cup with balj@ n— "7/, \_|w.2 fixing screws, TITANIUM 4 1] 515025 $601,00
50-34-353 cross head screws @ Z, 7310 mm N5 \self tapping, TITANIUM 6 5 76,09 $456,54
50-34-351 cross head screws @27 X8 mm~ IVIA  \ 0 [Self tapping, TITANIUM 20| 5 76,09 $1.521,80)
: = “z
Ontario ,%’ b 1
Tel.: +49 7424 98230-30 Corporation . 28 \ - o .
& DN
atyof| P [ ynitprice | Total price
Art. No. Description e :g_‘é usD UsD
50-34-355 cross head screws @ 2,7 x 12 mm self tapping, TITANIUM 20, 5 $76,09 $1.521,80
50-34-369 emergency screw, @ 3,0 x 9 mm cross head, TITANIUM, 7 5 $76,09 $532,63
50-34-373 emergency screw, @ 3,0 x 13 mm cross head, TITANIUM, 7 5 $76,09 $532,63
10-11-342 bottom non-perforated, 285x280x150 mm 1 1 FOC| FOC
10-11-389 |lid perforated, 285x280 mm, silver 1 1 FOC FOC|
10-06-489 Iwire basket 255x245x50 mm 1 1 FOC FOC
50-34-003 Rack for plates and screws 2,7mm system 1 1 FOC| FOC.
50-34-509 screwdriver handle only for all screwdriver blades 1 1 FOC FOC| C
50-34-514 screwdriver blade only, self-holding for cross head screws 1 1 FOC FOC
50-32-505 plate and screw hold. forceps, 150 mm, angled, TITANIUM 2 1 FOC| FOC|
06-15-115 reduction forceps 135 mm with points 2 1 FOC]| FOC
50-91-505 Biegezange f.2,7+3,5 mm Platten 240 mm 1 1 FOC| FOC
50-91-502 Bending iron for 2.7 / 3,5 mm plates right 1 1 FOC FOC|
50-91-503 Bending iron for 2,7 / 2.5 mm plates left 1 1 FOC FOC|
50-34-702 Drill Bit Stryker shaft 2mm, 105/75/35mm 5 1 FOC FOC
50-79-051 cutter 240 mm TC, f.plates and wire up to 3,2 mm 2 1 FOC| FOC
50-32-520 transbuccal drilling guide 1 1] FOC FOC.
Total Price per Set $11.764,20
Total Price for 47 Sets $552.917,40
FSM-DE17-010
50-31-134 medium orbita plate, 4-hol 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1 $74,07] $1.481,40
50-31-135 medium orbita plate, 6-hblesiT 7,0\ [0,6mm x 1,5 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1 $90,88 1.817,60
50-31-136 medium orbita plate, 8-holes; TITANIUMN.G' 0,6mm x 1,5 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1| $106,65 2.133,00)
50-31-137 medium orbita plate/ 16-holes, TTAARUEM \"0|,6mm x 1,5 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1] $13312 $2.662,40
50-32-223 mini orbita plate, 4/haled-FTANIUM.____ ﬂo\Smm X 2,0 mm, packing unit 1 pcse oo | 21 1}~ 570,65 $1.413,00)
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Qty of Unit Price | Total Price
Art. No. Description nacks per USD USD
50-32-224 mini orbita plate, 6-holes, TITANIUM 0,6mm x 2,0 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1 $95,19 $1.903,80
50-32-122 mini orbita plate, 8-holes, TITANIUM 0,6mm x 2,0 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1 $111,85] $2.237,00
50-32-123 mini orbita plate, 10-holes, TITANIUM 0,6mm x 2,0 mm, packing unit 1 pcs. 20 1 $139,81 $2.796,20
$16.444,40
FSM-DE22-015

50-36-203 mesh plate 70 x 90 x 0,3 mm, TITANIUM for 1,5 mm/2,0 mm screws 51 1 $147,70 7.532,70
50-36-201 mesh plate 50 x 70 x 0,3 mm, TITANIUM for 1,5 mm/2,0 mm screws 51 1 $88,35 4.505,85
50-31-251 mesh plate 60 x 60 x 0,1 mm, TITANIUM for 1,2 mm/1,5mm/2,0mm screws 51 1 $142,64 57.274,64
50-31-252 mesh plate 60 x 120 x 0,1 mm, TITANIUM for 1,2 mm/1,5mm/2,0mm screws 51 1 225,63 $11.507,13
50-31-254 mesh plate 60 x 60 x 0,2 mm, TITANIUM ]for 1,2 mm/1,5mm/2,0mm screws 51 1 149,78 $7.638,78
50-31-255 mesh plate 60 x 120 x 0,2 mm, TITANIUM |for 1,2 mm/1,5mm/2,0mm screws 51 1 239,02 $12.190,02
$50.649,12

payment terms: irrevocable letter of credit
delivery terms: CIP Baghdad




